
220km
of fire guards cleared for habitat 
protection from fire in and outside

of Hwange National Park

160 million
litres of water pumped for
wildlife every year across 

our 19 pumps

19
water pumps for over 10,000 
elephants and other species in 

and outside our concessions

$350,000
paid to National Parks, the 

national institution in charge of 
wildlife protection

323
patrols conducted in communal 
and forestry lands bordering

national parks

4,569 km
patrolled in communal & 
forestry lands bordering

national parks

292
snares found and retrieved by
community wildlife protection 

scouts

19
community wildlife protection 
scouts employed and trained 

from the communities

5,000
households and their livestock
supplied by domestic boreholes, 
over 80 of which we have drilled 
& over 100 of which we maintain

500,000
school lunches provided to 

school children across 13
schools

60 tonnes
of maize meal delivered to 
communities prior to the rains

3,500
households received 

community food aid to mitigate 
against drought effects

22,000
textbooks distributed to 69 schools

in villages around Hwange 
National Park

25,000
children benefitted from 
Imvelo’s work with schools 

13th

classroom block built in schools 
bordering Hwange National 

Park

195
children received bursaries to 

attend school and have 
uniforms and supplies paid

27,000th
person treated during our 2019 
and 9th-year running Smile and 

See Safari 

1,724
sunglasses were 

distributed to protect eyes 
from cataracts and 

ultraviolet light

740
fluoride applications for school 

children as part of our 
preventative dental care work

Over 5,000
toothbrushes were handed out 

to children and adults in our 
frontline communities

2019's Community

and Conservation Efforts

in Numbers…

JOIN US IN SAFEGUARDING OUR PEOPLE AND WILDLIFE.
For more information contact: 
donors@imvelosafarilodges.com

Water and Food for People

Habitat Protection

Education

Healthcare

Wildlife Protection

Over 75% 
of our staff, including those in Head Office, come from communities 

within walking distance of our National Parks or protected Forest Land

CONTRIBUTE


